
Brent & Judy

Dear Birthparents,

Thank you for taking the time to read our 
letter and for making an adoption plan.  We 
feel children are the greatest gift in life and 
should be treated as such.  Life doesn’t 
always go as planned and we know this from 
our own experiences.  After being married 
for five years and trying to conceive a child 
during those years we decided to adopt.  
Then the most wonderful surprise came our 
way.  When we applied to adopt through 
Adoption Circle, we learned we were 
expecting!  Samuel is our son and a 
blessing.  Raising Samuel and your child into 
happy young adults is not going to be an 
easy task into today’s world.  Our Christian 
beliefs and morals with the help of our 
extended families will guide us in the right 
direction.  Your baby will create joy and 
memories our family wouldn’t have had 
otherwise.  We will do everything in our 
power to provide him or her with a 
comfortable and loving home.  Thank you 
for making this decision.  You will make the 
best choice for this baby because you care, 
whether it’s our family or another one you 
choose.



About Us

Brent and I have been a couple for twelve years.  We 

met where we both worked in Virginia in 2004.  I was 

bold and asked Brent out on a date because he was 

handsome and kind.  He thankfully said yes.  We 

decided to move together to Ohio in 2006 for personal 

and professional reasons.  We were married in 2010 in 

a park near our house.  I graduated from college after 

earning a bachelor’s degree in aerospace engineering.  

Brent holds a degree in hospitality management.  He is 

a restaurant manager.  Brent is an excellent cook and 

we eat well because he likes to be creative and try 

new things.  I am not as creative and like to figure out 

difficult problems as a mechanical engineer. We love 

to be with our son and enjoy watching him grow, but 

know we need to be dedicated to our jobs to provide 

for our family.

Our Families

Brent was born in Cincinnati, Ohio.  He grew up in the suburbs of Cincinnati and 

Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania with his mother, father and two brothers.  Brent’s parents 

are both happily married to other people.  His father, stepmother and two brothers 

live in central Florida.  His mother and stepfather live in Cincinnati.  They are all 

fun, loving and very supportive of us.  Sadly, Brent’s younger brother died 

prematurely at 28 from a sudden illness.  Brent has many aunts, uncles and cousins 

in Ohio and elsewhere.  He also has five nieces and one nephew.

I was born in Pensacola, Florida.  I have two brothers and a sister.  My father 

passed away in 2014.  My mother and stepfather live in Maryland and visit us when 

time permits.  I also have many aunts, uncles and cousins that live all over the 

country and a niece Rachael that loves horses.  She is quite the equestrian.



Where We Live

We live in a historic neighborhood near a river and a downtown area.  We 

purchased our first house in 2009 and have renovated it extensively.  It is a 

traditional Victorian home in a historic district and very close to parks, schools 

and other amenities.  We like living here and going to the metro parks located 

all around us.  We enjoy hiking, taking walks, going to the zoo with Samuel and 

going to the local markets.  We are close to some relatives and visit them 

often.  We have one dog named Roscoe and he protects his family and home 

diligently.

Judy Brent

Hobbies Hiking, 

kayaking, 

reading

Golf, bicycling

Favorite 

Sports Teams

Tampa Bay 

Buccaneers, 

Columbus Blue 

Jackets

Cincinnati 

Bengals, 

Cincinnati Reds

Favorite Foods Spaghetti, 

Chicago Dog

Skyline Chili, 

Nachos



Personally Speaking

Judy is my best friend.  I know that I can always count on 

her when I have had a rough day at work to make me smile 

when I get home.  I knew from the moment I met her that 

we would be together for the rest of our lives.  Judy works 

very hard, but still manages to come home in a great mood 

every day.  She is a beautiful and brilliant woman that I 

admire with all of my heart.  She inspires me to be a better 

person and I couldn’t ask for a better person to spend the 

rest of my life with.

Brent is my life partner.  You always desire that friend that 

will defend you even when you are absolutely wrong.  

That’s a best friend and he is mine.  He accepts me for who 

I am and loves me with all my flaws.  He works very hard to 

provide for our needs and desires.  I am challenged at work 

frequently and I can’t wait to get home every day because 

Brent is there.  He doesn’t demand I do anything when I 

come home.  He asks me how my day went and if he can 

get me anything.  He is very warm and caring.  I know he 

always pictured himself with children one day.  There is no 

other man on this planet I would want to have children with 

and because of that, I feel strongly we were meant to find 

one another and be parents together.

Our Future

The future is bright for us!  With our careers, our wonderful son Samuel and 

adopting your child, life is exhilarating.  We feel blessed and have worked very 

hard over the years to be at this special moment of adopting and growing our 

family.  We believe strongly in a higher being and that our most important job on 

Earth started when we had Samuel and is going to continue as he and your child 

grow up together.  They will be our highest priority and our family and friends will 

love them dearly.  When we need or want a helping hand, they will come no 

matter how far they have to travel.  Whatever decision you make, we feel you are 

blessed as well.  Good luck and live your life to the fullest!


